
Shabbat, August 12th, 5pm—AMIT Hindy 
Weinstock Geula Teaneck Chapter invites you 
to a Torah Mizion Shiur at the home of 
Jennifer and Benjamin Hooper, 544 Rutland 
Avenue, Teaneck. Laura Hoenig Silbermann, 
Shlicha for Mizrachi in Manchester, England, 
will speak about “A Broken Vessel: Teshuva 
From Fear or Love”.  For more information or 
to register go to amitchildren.org/shiur/ or 
contact Robbie Fried at 
RobbieF@amitchildren.org. 
 
Exciting Job Opportunity in Bergenfield/
Teaneck! Jewish Association for 
Developmental Disabilities (J-ADD) is looking 
for a paid staff member to provide religious 
support and hang out during Shabbat with 
highly independent Men with Developmental 
Disabilities living in Teaneck/Bergenfield. Staff 
work 1-2 Shabbats per month. Must be 18 
years of age or older and be available for a 
period of training and preparation before 
starting work. Both men and women are 
encouraged to apply. Interested candidates 
should send a resume to Rabbi Yaakov 
Grossman at jgrossman@j-add.org. 
 
The BMT is on break for the summer. Our 
program will fully resume after the Chagim, 
bezH. Information re: our Yom Iyun prior to 
Rosh Hashana will be posted closer to that 
date. Please write to BMTeaneck@Gmail.com 
if you'd like to be included on our mailing list. 
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